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 Arkansas Museum of Fine Arts to Create Over 100 New Jobs 

Will Host On-Site Hiring Events in February 
 
 
LITTLE ROCK, Ark. (February 2, 2023) – The Arkansas Museum of Fine Arts (AMFA) is 
creating over 100 new jobs as the museum prepares for its grand opening on April 22, 2023. 
AMFA is hiring both part-time and full-time positions targeting skillsets and expertise in a wide 
range of fields. AMFA will host a series of on-site hiring events in February for potential 
applicants.  
  
“AMFA is a cultural hub for Little Rock with a mission to build community through the visual and 
performing arts,” said Dr. Victoria Ramirez, executive director. “We are working together to 
improve the quality of life in our region and are excited to expand our team and impact.”   
  
Currently, AMFA has administrative, custodial, food services, guest experience, sales associate, 
security, special events, and other positions available. AMFA is hiring artists to teach classes in 
a variety of media. For additional information about job openings, please visit AMFA’s website. 
  
AMFA will hold job fairs at the museum on February 15, February 16, February 22, and 
February 23, from 9 a.m. to 5 p.m. Interested applicants can park in the lot labeled “Employee 
Parking” off 10th and Commerce in downtown Little Rock. Applicants are encouraged to bring 
copies of their resume with references included.  
 
 
 

# # # 
 
About the Arkansas Museum of Fine Arts 
Founded in 1937, the Arkansas Museum of Fine Arts is the largest cultural institution of its kind 
in the state, offering a unique blend of visual and performing arts experiences. AMFA is 
committed to featuring diverse media and artistic perspectives within its permanent collection of 



14,000 works of art as well as through rotating temporary exhibitions. AMFA’s international 
collection spans seven centuries, with strengths in works on paper and contemporary craft, and 
includes notable holdings by artists from Arkansas, the Mid-South region, and across the United 
States and Europe. With a vibrant mix of ideas, cultures, people, and places, AMFA extends this 
commitment to diversity through its dynamic children’s theatre and performing arts program, the 
innovative Windgate Art School, and community-focused educational programs for all ages. 
Located in Little Rock’s oldest urban green space, MacArthur Park, AMFA’s landmark building 
and grounds are designed by Studio Gang and SCAPE, in collaboration with Polk Stanley 
Wilcox Architects.  
 
 


